
E-BIKES ARE cheating and riding 
one isn’t proper cycling. Folding 
bikes aren’t proper bikes and riding 
one is embarrassing. Not my 
opinions, but ones you’ll 
sometimes see expressed on 
internet forums inhabited by Proper 
Cyclists. Proper Cyclists who have 
spectacularly missed the point of 
both kinds of bike. 

E-bikes and folders aren’t 
alternatives to ‘proper’ cycling; 
they’re alternatives to not cycling. 
They enable people to cycle when 
they otherwise wouldn’t. The 
cycling cake isn’t being cut into 
smaller slices. It’s a bigger cake. 
Who doesn’t want more cycling or, 
for that matter, more cake?

I don’t own an e-bike yet but it’s 
only a matter of time. And I don’t 
mean 20 or 30 years. Hills and 
distances can be a struggle even 
now. Not on most of my bikes, just 
one in particular: the cargo bike. 
With a heavy load, hills are as hard 
on that as I expect them to be on 
all bikes in years to come. An 
electric-assist kit like the one 
Richard Hallett tried this issue 
(p54) might be just the job, given 
that I don’t want or need a 
completely new machine. 

A folding bike, meanwhile, lets 
cycling seep into all those gaps in 
your life where you might otherwise 
be bereft of a bike. You don’t wheel 
out your Brompton in preference to 
your beloved titanium bike (at 
least, I don’t). You ride it when the 
alternatives are walking, taking a 
taxi, or waiting for a bus or the 
Tube. Want to spend more time 
cycling? Get a folder: job done.
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